Envelope Contract Date: 9-27-11 RFB092211-01
Human Services Qty: Multipel
470-1987 470-2060 470-2279 470-3724 470-3836 470-4147 470-4196 470-4204 470-4467 470-4553
470-1938 470-1962 FIP Warrant 470-1988 470-2054 #9 Courtesy Warrant 470-3593 470-3608 33/4x61/2 9x 12 470-3914 470-3989 470-4146 | #10 Double 470-4184 470-4187 33/4x61/2 9x 12 470-4213 470-4223 470-4240 | #10 Double | #9 Courtesy | 470-4691 470-5036
#10 Window | #10 Window Window #10 Regular #9 BRM Reply Window #9 BRM #10 Window | BRM - Blue Window #10 Window | #11 Window | #10 Window Window #10 Window | #10 Window | BRM Envelope Window #10 Window | #10 Window | #10 Window Window Reply #10 Window | #10 Window
Vendor 90,000 50,000 80,000 50,000 Window 90,000 20,000 45,000 50,000 30,000 30,000 30,000 30,000 30,000 60,000 825,000 75,000 50,000 25,000 80,000 20,000 140,000 60,000 20,000 30,000 90,000 150,000 Total

Cenveo $2,077.20 $1,196.00 $2,515.20 $1,036.50 $2,694.60 $558.20 $1,414.80 $990.50 $1,212.60 $1,413.00 $2,597.10 $1,367.10 $1,614.00 $1,426.20 $17,061.00 $1,764.00 $1,196.00 $1,226.25 $3,040.15 $588.80 $3,206.00 $1,243.80 $413.60 $666.90 $2,077.20 $3,427.50| $58,024.20
ADI $1,989.90 $1,135.00 $2,586.40 $1,015.50 $1,805.40 $490.80 $1,518.75 $1,015.50 $1,026.60 $954.30 $3,670.80 $1,105.80 $1,512.90 $1,354.80 $16,780.50 $1,664.25 $1,135.00 $717.50 $5,757.60 $540.60 $2,959.60 $1,211.40 $1,258.80 $644.40 $1,989.90 $3,157.50| $58,999.50
MacDonald $1,944.90 $1,080.50 $2,548.00 $949.50 $2,118.60 $405.40 $1,736.10 $963.50 $937.80 $960.90 $2,713.20 $951.00 $1,103.70 $1,296.60 $17,580.75 $1,620.75 $1,080.50 $645.75 $5,609.60 $452.20 $3,025.40 $1,139.40 $486.20 $608.10 $1,944.90 $3,241.50| $57,144.75
Straub $2,131.20 $1,348.00 $2,115.20 $1,088.50 $2,176.20 $642.60 $1,417.50 $1,099.00 $899.40 $969.30 $3,268.80 $1,029.60 $1,485.30 $1,590.60| $16,632.00 $1,948.25 $1,348.00 $784.50 $6,960.00 $790.00 $2,947.00 $1,291.20 $937.00 $794.10 $2,092.50 $3,192.00| $60,977.75
1Pl $3,168.00[No Bid No Bid $1,505.00 No Bid $664.00 No Bid $1,570.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,112.00 No Bid $2,640.00 $1,760.00|No Bid No Bid $722.00 $4,928.00 $1,806.00 No Bid $942.00 $3,168.00 No Bid
Priority Envelope No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $694.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Garner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Comments




